CITY OF WASHINGTON

WASHINGTON, ILLINOIS

TO: Mayor Manier and City Council

FROM: Ed Andrews, Public Works Director

DATE: April 14, 2017

SUBJECT:  Bid Award — FY 17-18 Class S| Ready-Mix Concrete

On Wednesday, March 29, 2017, bids were opened and publicly read for the City’s purchase and

delivery of Class Sl ready-mix concrete for various uses by the Public Works Department. The

estimated quantities listed below were used for canvassing purposes only and the City is not obligated
to purchase these quantities. Bid documents were forwarded to four prospective suppliers and three

proposals were received. The following is a summary of bid results.

Estimated Unit Calcium | Winter
Supplier Quantity Contract Price Extended Charge | Charge
Delivered Quantity | per C.Y. Total per per C.Y.
%IC.Y.
Roanoke Concrete 1.0t01.75C.Y. | 25C.Y. $129 $3225.00
1275 Springbay Rd. 20t02.75C.Y. 50 C.Y. $116 $5800.00 $2.00 $5.00
E.Peoria, Il. 61611 >3.0C.Y. 50 C.Y. $100 $5000.00 per % per C.Y.
Flowable 50 C.Y. $49.90 $2495 per C.Y
Total
$16,520.00
United Ready Mix 1.0t0 1.75 C.Y. 25C.Y. $118.85 $2971.25
1 Leland St. 20to2.75C.Y. 50 C.Y. $113.85 $5692.50 $2.50 $6.50
Peoria, 1. 61602 >3.0C.Y. 50 C.Y. $108.85 45442.50 per % | per C.Y.
Flowable 50 C.Y. $50.00 $2500.00 per C.Y
Total
$16,606.25
VCNA Prairie 1.0t0 1.75 C.Y. 25C.Y. $137 $3425.00 $2.75
100 Cass St 20to2.75C.Y. 50 C.Y. $121 $6050.00 per% $6.00
Peoria, 11 61602 >3.0CY 50 C.Y. $102 $5100.00 per C.Y. | per C.Y.
309-697-0576 Flowable 50 C.Y. $56.75 $2837.00
Total
$17412.50

Excluding the amount for flowable this year’s prices reflect a 2.1% increase over last year’s bid price.

Based on the above, it is recommended that the City Council award the bid for the City’s purchase
and delivery of Class Sl ready-mix concrete and flowable fill for FY 17-18 to Roanoke Concrete, at the

above noted unit prices.

This matter is being placed on the Council’s consent agenda for review and action at the meeting of

April 17, 2017.

ccC: Kirk Hoog
Rick Janes
File




CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION

PUBLIC SERVICES DOCUMENT NO. PW-17-03

FY 17-18 CLASS S| CONCRETE

BID OPENING: Wednesday March 29, 2017  1:00 p.m.
Estimated Unit Calcium | Winter
Supplier Quantity Contract Price Extended Charge | Charge
Delivered Quantity | per C.Y. Total per per C.Y.
%I/C.Y.
Roanoke Concrete 1.0t01.75C.Y. | 25C.Y. $129 $3225.00
1275 Springbay Rd. 20t02.75CY. | 50C.. $116 $5800.00 $2.00 $5.00
E.Peoria, Il. 61611 >3.0C.Y. 50 C.Y. $100 $5000.00 per % | perC.Y.
Flowable 50 C.Y. $49.90 $2495 per C.Y
Total
$16,520.00
United Ready Mix 1.0t01.75C.Y. | 25C.Y. $118.85 $2971.25
1 Leland St. 20t02.75CY. | 50C.. $113.85 $5692.50 $2.50 $6.50
Peoria, Il. 61602 >3.0C.Y. 50 C.Y. $108.85 45442 .50 per % | per C.Y.
Flowable 50 C.Y. $50.00 $2500.00 per C.Y
Total
$16,606.25
VCNA Prairie 1.0t01.75C.Y. | 25C.Y. $137 $3425.00 $2.75
100 Cass St 20t02.75CY. | 50C.. $121 $6050.00 per% $6.00
Peoria, Il 61602 >3.0CY 50 C.Y. $102 $5100.00 per C.Y. | per C.Y.
309-697-0576 Flowable 50 C.Y. $56.75 $2837.00
Total
$17412.50

*Winter Charge Effective November 1, 2017- March 31, 2018




CITY OF WASHINGTON
WASHINGTON, ILLINOIS

TO: Mayor Manier and City Council
FROM: Ed Andrews, Public Works Director
DATE: April 14, 2017

SUBJECT: Bid Award — FY 17-18 Water Softener Salt

On Wednesday, March 29, 2017, bids were to be opened and publicly read for the City’s
purchase and delivery of approximately 1,250 tons of Industrial Grade Water Softener Salt for
use at the City’s Water Treatment Plants. Bid documents were forwarded to four prospective
suppliers and no proposals were received by the March 29, 2017 deadline. Morton Salt was the
lowest bidder in 15/16 and again in 16/17 and were contacted to see if they would honor their
bid price from the 2016/2017 fiscal year. Attached is the signed proposal honoring last year’s
bid.

Supplier Unit Price Total Cost
Morton International $106.33 $132,912.50
Cargill Salt No Bid No Bid
North American Salt No Bid No Bid
Gunther Salt Company No Bid No Bid

The above price compares to last year’s awarded unit price of $106.33/Ton, which represents a
0% increase in cost from the same supplier.

Based on the above, it is recommend that the City Council award the bid for the City’s purchase
and delivery of Industrial Grade Coarse Water Softener Salt for FY 17-18 to Morton
International, Inc. — Morton Salt Division, Chicago, IL, at a unit price of $106.33/ton.

This matter is being placed on the Council’s consent agenda for review and action at the
meeting of April 17, 2017.

CC: Tim Randall
File



CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION
PUBLIC SERVICES DOCUMENT NO. PW-17-04
FY 17-18 INDUSTRIAL GRADE COARSE WATER SOFTENER SALT

BID OPENING: Wednesday March 29, 2017 1:00 p.m.

ESTIMATED
COMPANY QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL

Morton International, Inc.
Morton Salt Division 1250 $106.33 $132,912.50
123 N. Wacker Drive

Chicago, IL 60606-1743

Cargill Salt
Attn: Don Yingling 1,250 Tons No Bid No Bid
P.O. Box 1403

Hutchinson, KS 67504-1403

North American Salt
3089 Cardinal Ct. NE 1,250 Tons No Bid No Bid
North Liberty, IA 52317

Gunther Salt Company
101 Buchanan Street 1,250 Tons No Bid No Bid
St. Louis, MO 63147




CITY OF WASHINGTON
WASHINGTON, ILLINOIS

TO: Mayor Manier and City Council
FROM: Ed Andrews, Public Works Director
SUBJECT: Bid Award — Annual Tree Maintenance Contract

DATE: April 14, 2017

On Wednesday, March 29, 2017 bids were opened and publicly read for the City’s annual tree
maintenance contract. Bid documents were provided to nine (9) prospective bidders. Two
bidders responded. Attached, please find the bid tabulation sheet.

TREE REMOVAL STUMP TREE
COMPANY PRICE PER TREE REMOVAL | TRIMMING
Durdel & Sons Tree 6”-18” DBH $275.00
1726 N. Prichard Road 19”-30” DBH $425.00 $2.50/inch | $135.00/hour
Peoria, IL 61615 317-42” DBH $790.00
43” and up DBH $1200.00
Gene’s Tree Service 6”-18” DBH $600.00
19”-30” DBH $1200.00 $4.00/inch | $350.00/hour
317-42” DBH $1800.00
43” and up DBH $2600.00
Whistle Tree Service
Ted Durdel Landscape
and Tree Service
Sewel Brothers Tree
Experts
Hardesty Tree Service No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bennet & Sons
F&F Tree Service
Andrews Tree Service

* D.B.H. — Diameter breast height measurement of tree trunk

Based upon the above, | would recommend that the City Council award the bid for the City’s
annual tree maintenance contract to Durdel & Sons Tree Service of Peoria, IL.

This matter has been placed on the agenda for the City Council meeting of Monday April 17,
2017 for review and consideration.

Attachment

cc: Kirk Hoog, Streets Supervisor

File




CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION
PUBLIC SERVICES DOCUMENT NO. PW-17-05

ANNUAL TREE MAINTENANCE
BID OPENING: Wednesday, March 29, 2017  1:00 p.m.

TREE REMOVAL STUMP TREE
COMPANY PRICE PER TREE REMOVAL | TRIMMING
Durdel & Sons Tree 6”-18” DBH $275.00
1726 N. Prichard Road 197-30” DBH $425.00 $2.50/inch | $135.00/hour
Peoria, IL 61615 317-42” DBH $790.00
43” and up DBH $1200.00

Gene’s Tree Service 6”-18” DBH $600.00

19”7-30” DBH $1200.00 $4.00/inch | $350.00/hour

317-42” DBH $1800.00
43” and up DBH  $2600.00

Whistle Tree Service
Ted Durdel Landscape
and Tree Service
Sewel Brothers Tree No Bid No Bid No Bid
Experts

Hardesty Tree Service
Bennet & Sons

F&F Tree Service
Andrews Tree Service

* D.B.H. — Diameter breast height measurement of tree trunk
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