CITY OF WASHINGTON
WASHINGTON, ILLINOIS

TO: Mayor Manier and City Council
FROM: Kevin Schone
DATE: April 1, 2019

SUBJECT:  Bid Award ~ FY19/20 Hot-mix Asphalt

On Wednesday, March 27, 2019, bids were opened and publicly read for the City’s purchase of
approximately 500 tons of hot-mix asphalt, which is used by the Public Works Department for
general street patching and restoration of sewer and water repairs. The estimated quantity of
500 Tons was used for canvassing purposes only and the City is not obligated to purchase this
quantity. Bid documents were forwarded to two prospective suppliers and two proposals were
received. The following is a summary of bid results.

Estimated Unit ]
Supplier Quantity Price Total B
River City Supply
121 W. Park St.
P. O. Box 166 500Tons $70.00/Ton | $35,000.00

Tremont, IL 61568

Tazewell County Asphalt Co., Inc. |
23497 Ridge Road 500Tons $73.00 $36,500.00
East Peoria, IL 61611

The above price from River City Supply compares to last year’s awarded unit price of
$70.00/Ton, which represents a 0% increase in cost.

The above price from Tazewell County Asphalt compares to last year’s price of $73.00/Ton,
which represents no increase in cost.

Based on the above, it is recommended that the City Council award the bid for the City’s
purchase of hot-mix asphalt for FY 19-20 to River City Supply of Tremont at the unit price of
$70.00/ton.

Staff also recommends Tazewell County Asphalt at $73.00/Ton when River City Supply is not
able to provide the product needed by Public Works to prevent delays in planned work.

This matter is being placed on the Council's consent agenda for review and action at the
meeting of April 1, 2019.

cc: Kirk Hoog
File
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TO:
FROM:
DATE:
SUBJECT:

CITY OF WASHINGTON

WASHINGTON, ILLINOIS

Mayor Manier and City Council

Kevin Schone Public Works Manager
April 1, 2019
Bid Award — FY 19/20 Class S| Ready-Mix Concrete

On Wednesday, March 27, 2019, bids were opened and publicly read for the City’s purchase and
delivery of Class Sl ready-mix concrete for various uses by the Public Works Department. The
estimated quantities listed below were used for canvassing purposes only and the City is not obligated
to purchase these quantities. Bid documents were forwarded to four prospective suppliers and three

proposals were received. The following is a summary of bid results.

]- Estimated Unit Calcium | Winter
Supplier Quantity Contract Price Extended Charge | Charge
Delivered Quantity | per C.Y. Total per per C.Y.
%ICY. |
Roanoke Concrete 1.0t0 1.75 C.Y. 25CY. $132.00 $3300.00 | '
1275 Springbay Rd. 20t 2.75C.Y. 50C.Y. $117.00 $5850.00 $225 $6.00
E. Peoria, Il. 61611 >3.0C.Y. 50 C.Y. $99.00 $4950.00 per% | perC.Y.
Flowable 50C.Y. $50.75 $2537.00 per C.Y
Total
_ a $16.637.50
VCNA Prairie 1.0t01.75CY. | 25C.Y. $134.00 $3350.00
100 Cass St 20to2.75C.Y. 50C.Y. $117.00 $5850.00 $2.50 $6.00
Peoria, 11 61602 >30C.Y. 50C.Y. $103.00 $5150.00 per % per C.Y.
309-697-0576 Flowable 50C.Y. $54.00 $2700.00 per C.Y
Total
$17.050.00
United Ready-Mix 1.0to 1.75 C.Y. 25CY. $125.85 $3146.25
1 Leland Street 20t0o2.75C.Y. 50C.Y. $121.85 $6092.50 $2.50 $7.50
Peoria, IL 61602-1818 >3.0C.Y. 50 C.Y. $117.85 $5892.50 Per % Per %
Flowable 50C.Y $52.00 $2600.00 PerC.Y. | Per C.Y.
Total
$17,731.25

Eased on the above, it is recommended that the City Council award the bid for the City's purchase
and delivery of Class S| ready-mix concrete and flowable fill for FY 19/20 to Roanoke Concrete, at the
above noted unit prices. If approved, this year’s prices reflect a .4% increase over last year's bid price.

This matter is being placed on the Council's consent agenda for review and action at the meeting of

April 1, 2019.

cc: Kirk Hoog

Rick Janes



CITY OF WASHINGTON
WASHINGTON, ILLINOIS

TO: Mayor Manier and City Council
FROM: Kevin Schone, Public Works Manager
DATE: April 1, 2019

SUBJECT: Bid Award — FY 19-20 Water Softener Salt

On Wednesday, March 27, 2019, bids were to be opened and publicly read for the City’s
purchase and delivery of approximately 1,250 tons of Industrial Grade Water Softener Salt for
use at the City’s Water Treatment Plants. Bid documents were forwarded to five prospective
suppliers and two proposals were received. The following are the results of this effort.

Supplier Unit Price Total Cost
Morton International No Bid No Bid
Cargill Salt $117.03 $146,287.50
Compass Minerals No Bid No Bid
Gunther Salt Company $109.50 $136,875.00
Water Solutions No Bid No Bid
Unlimited

The above price compares to last year's awarded unit price of $106.23/Ton, which represents a
3.0 % increase in cost.

Based on the above, it is recommended that the City Council award the bid for the City’s
purchase and delivery of Industrial Grade Coarse Water Softener Salt for FY 19-20 to Gunther
Salt of St. Louis Missouri at a unit price of $106.23/ton.

This matter is being placed on the Council’'s consent agenda for review and action at the
meeting of April 1, 2019.

cC: Tim Randall
File
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CITY OF WASHINGTON
WASHINGTON, ILLINOIS

TO: Mayor Manier and City Council
FROM: Kevin Schone, Public Works Manager
DATE: April 1, 2019

SUBJECT:  Bid Award — FY 19/20 Cast in Place Pipe

On Wednesday, March 27, 2019, bids were opened and publicly read for CIPP. Bid documents were
forwarded to two prospective suppliers and one was received. The estimated quantities listed below
were used for canvassing purposes only and the City is not obligated to purchase these quantities.

The following is a summary of bid results.

Supplier Quantity 6" 8" 10 Service
Delivered Re-connect
Per ft. Per ft. Per ft. Per service
Hoerr Construction
0to300LF
1416 County Rd $80.00 $54.00 $62.00 $100.00
200 North 30010 1000LF | $42.00 $29.00 $33.00 $100.00
Goodfield, 11 61742
>> 1000 LF $38.00 $27.00 $29.00 $100.00
0to 300 LF
No Other Bidders
300 to 1000 LF N/A. N/A N/A N/A

>>1000 LF

Based on the above, it is recommended that Council award the bid for CIPP to Hoerr Construction at
the contract prices noted above.

This matter is being placed on the Council’s consent agenda for review and action at the meeting of

April 1, 2019.

cc: Rick Janes
File




