
 

     CITY OF WASHINGTON, ILLINOIS 
City Council Agenda Communication 

 

 

 

Meeting Date:  April 4th, 2022 

 

Prepared By: Kevin Schone 

 

Agenda Item: Tree Maintenance Bid Award  

 

Explanation: On Wednesday, March 30th, 2022 bids were opened and publicly read for the 

City’s annual tree maintenance contract. Bid documents were provided to five (12) prospective 

bidders with four bidders responding.  Below are the results of the bids submitted. 

 

 
 

Fiscal Impact: $18,000 between the street department and cemetery budgets. 

 

Recommendation/ 

Committee Discussion Summary: As you can see from the above bid tabulation, Durdel & 

Sons Tree Service of Peoria is the low bidder. Durdel has provided quality work when 

completing job assignments for the city and has a proven track record, as such, staff 

recommends approval of Durdel & Sons. The selected contractor will only trim trees, remove 

trees, or perform stump grinding when the city notifies them of the need for such services. 

 

Action Requested:  Approval. 
 

COMPANY
TREE REMOVAL 

PRICE PER TREE

Durdel  & Sons Tree Service

6" - 18"   DBH   

19" - 30"   DBH

31" - 42"   DBH

43" and Up   DBH

$

$

$

$

300.00

600.00

825.00

1,525.00

$ 3.00 Per Inch $ 240.00 Per/Hr  $ 160.00 Per Hour

JIMAX

6" - 18"   DBH   

19" - 30"   DBH

31" - 42"   DBH

43" and Up   DBH

$

$

$

$

310.00

690.00

1,150.00

2,650.00

$ 6.30 Per Inch
$ 95.00 Per Man

            Per Hour
$ 280.00 Per Hour

Zehr Property Maintenance

6" - 18"   DBH   

19" - 30"   DBH

31" - 42"   DBH

43" and Up   DBH

$

$

$

$

600.00

1,200.00

1,800.00

3,000.00

$ 6.00 Per Inch $ No Bid $ 250.00 Per Hour

Fisher Tree

6" - 18"   DBH   

19" - 30"   DBH

31" - 42"   DBH

43" and Up   DBH

$

$

$

$

No Bid
$  No Bid $ No Bid $ 400.00 Per Hour

STUMP REMOVALUNIT PRICE TREE TRIMMINGAlternate Bid


