
 
CITY OF WASHINGTON, ILLINOIS 
      City Council Agenda Communication 

 
 
 
Meeting Date: Monday March 18, 2024 
 
Prepared By: Brian Rittenhouse – Public Works Director 
 
Agenda Item: Purchase Authorization – Commodity Bid and Contractor Assistance. 
 
Explanation:  Attached are the results of Fiscal Year 24-25 Commodities Bids and Contractor 

Assistance.  Below is the list of the Commodity Bids and Contractor Assistance that 
Staff would recommend approving.  Asphalt and Concrete, Staff looks to approve both 
in case one is not able to provide material at the time of need. 

 
Fiscal Impact: PW-24-01 Hot Mix Asphalt $184,000.00 
   UCM  
   Tazewell County Asphalt 
  
 PW-24-02 Class SI Concrete $75,000.00 
  Prairie Material 

Roanoke Concrete 
 

 PW-24-03 Treatment Chemical Treatment 
  Brenntag Mid-South – Ferric Chloride & Fluoride $51,000.00 
  Water Solutions Unlimited - Phosphate 27,000.00 
  SNF Polydyne - Polymer $18,000.00 
  Hawkins Inc. – Chlorine 32,000.00 
  
 PW-24-04 Softener Salt $126,000.00 
  Midwest Salt 
 
 PW-24-05 Tree Maintenance Assistance $25,000.00 
  Durdel & Sons Tree Service 
 
 PW-24-06 Concrete Assistance $216,000.00 
  Lonewolf Concrete - Curb and Flatwork 
   
 PW-24-08 Weed Spraying Assistance $30,000.00 
  Golf Green 
 
 PW-24-09 CIPP Lining/Maintenance Assistance $755,000.00 

Hoerr Construction - Televising, Jetting, Manhole Lining and CIPP Lining 
Sanitary and Storm. 

 
Staff Recommendation: Staff recommends Purchase Authorization for up to the listed amounts with the listed 

Contractors for Fiscal Year 2024/2025 Commodities and Assistance. 



Action Requested:  Approve Purchase Authorization for the above listed Contractors and Amounts for
   FY 24-25 Commodities and Assistance Bids as a Consent Agenda Item. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

COMPANY ESTIMATED QUANTITY

UCM
P.O. Box 166
Tremont, Illinois 61568

1500 Tons $ 92.50 $ 138,750.00

Tazewell County Asphalt
23497 Ridge Road
East Peoria, Illinois 61611

1500 Tons $ 92.00 $ 138,000.00

CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION

PUBLIC WORKS DOCUMENT NO. PW-24-01
FY 24-25 HOT-MIX ASPHALT

BID OPENING: Tuesday February 6th, 2024     11:00 AM

UNIT PRICE TOTAL



 

COMPANY Class SI

Quantity Delivered
Estimated 

Contract Quanity

< 3.0 C.Y. 100 C.Y. $ $145.00 $ None $ $14,500.00

≥ 3.0 C.Y. 150 C.Y. $ $126.50 $ None $ $18,975.00
4000 lbs White Rock 5

Quantity Delivered
Estimated 

Contract Quanity

< 3.0 C.Y. 100 C.Y. $ $139.00 $ None $ $13,900.00

≥ 3.0 C.Y. 150 C.Y. $ $121.66 $ None $ $18,249.00
Flowable Fill

Quantity Delivered
Estimated 

Contract Quanity

≥ 3.0 C.Y. 300 C.Y. $ $77.50 $ None $ $23,250.00

Calcium Charge $ $3.00 Per C.Y.

Winter Charge $ $10.00 Per C.Y.

PP2 Charge $ $24.00 Per C.Y.

COMPANY Class SI

Quantity Delivered
Estimated 

Contract Quanity

< 3.0 C.Y. 100 C.Y. $ $153.50 $ None $ $15,350.00

≥ 3.0 C.Y. 150 C.Y. $ $133.50 $ None $ $20,025.00
4000 lbs White Rock

Quantity Delivered
Estimated 

Contract Quanity

< 3.0 C.Y. 100 C.Y. $ $150.50 $ None $ $15,050.00

≥ 3.0 C.Y. 150 C.Y. $ $130.50 $ None $ $19,575.00
Flowable Fill

Quantity Delivered
Estimated 

Contract Quanity

≥ 3.0 C.Y. 300 C.Y. $ $80.75 $ None $ $24,225.00

Calcium Charge $ $2.25 Per C.Y.

Winter Charge $ $8.00 Per C.Y.

PP2 Charge $ $185.75 Per C.Y.

COMPANY Class SI
Quantity Delivered

 
Contract Quanity

< 3.0 C.Y. 100 C.Y. $ $134.50 $ $100.00 $ $13,450.00
≥ 3.0 C.Y. 150 C.Y. $ $134.50 $ None $ $20,175.00

4000 lbs White Rock

Quantity Delivered
Estimated 

Contract Quanity
< 3.0 C.Y. 100 C.Y. $ $128.75 $ $100.00 $ $12,875.00
≥ 3.0 C.Y. 150 C.Y. $ $128.75 $ None $ $19,312.50

Flowable Fill

Quantity Delivered
Estimated 

Contract Quanity
≥ 3.0 C.Y. 300 C.Y. $ $77.50 $ $100.00 $ $23,250.00

Calcium Charge $ $3.00 Per C.Y.

Winter Charge $ $7.50 Per C.Y.

PP2 Charge $ $155.85 Per C.Y.

Minimum Charge Extended Totals

CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION

PUBLIC WORKS DOCUMENT NO. PW-24-02
FY 24-25 CLASS SI CONCRETE, 4,000 psi White Rock, Flowable Fill

BID OPENING: Tuesday February 6th, 2024     11:00 AM

VCNA Prairie

Roanoke

Unit Price Minimum Charge Extended Totals

Unit Price Minimum Charge Extended Totals

Unit Price

Minimum Charge Extended Totals

Unit Price Minimum Charge Extended Totals

Unit Price Minimum Charge Extended Totals

Unit Price

United Ready Mix

Unit Price Minimum Charge Extended Totals

Unit Price Minimum Charge Extended Totals

Unit Price Minimum Charge Extended Totals



 
 

COMPANY
1 Liquid Chlorine - 150 lbs. 70 $ 178.50 ea. $ 12,495.00
2 Liquid Chlorine - 1 Ton 8 $ 2,008.00 ea. $ 16,064.00
3 Hydrofluosilicic Acid 40 $ 129.00 ea. $ 5,160.00
4 Ferric Chloride 180,000 $ 0.250 lb. $ 45,000.00
5 Polymer 9,500 $ 1.85 lb. $ 17,575.00
6 WSU 350 Phosphate 10,500 $ No Bid lb. $

1 Liquid Chlorine - 150 lbs. 70 $ No Bid ea. $
2 Liquid Chlorine - 1 Ton 8 $ No Bid ea. $
3 Hydrofluosilicic Acid 40 $ 135.00 ea. $ 5,400.00
4 Ferric Chloride 180,000 $ 0.380 lb. $ 68,400.00
5 Polymer 9,500 $ No Bid lb. $
6 WSU 350 Phosphate 10,500 $ 2.65 lb. $ 27,825.00

1 Liquid Chlorine - 150 lbs. 70 $ No Bid ea. $
2 Liquid Chlorine - 1 Ton 8 $ No Bid ea. $
3 Hydrofluosilicic Acid 40 $ No Bid ea. $
4 Ferric Chloride 180,000 $ No Bid lb. $
5 Polymer 9,500 $ 1.69 lb. $ 16,055.00
6 WSU 350 Phosphate 10,500 $ No Bid lb. $

1 Liquid Chlorine - 150 lbs. 70 $ 177.00 ea. $ 12,390.00
2 Liquid Chlorine - 1 Ton 8 $ 1,814.00 ea. $ 14,512.00
3 Hydrofluosilicic Acid 40 $ No Bid ea. $
4 Ferric Chloride 180,000 $ 0.384 lb. $ 69,120.00
5 Polymer 9,500 $ 3.20 lb. $ 30,400.00
6 WSU 350 Phosphate 10,500 $ No Bid lb. $

1 Liquid Chlorine - 150 lbs. 70 $ No Bid ea. $
2 Liquid Chlorine - 1 Ton 8 $ No Bid ea. $
3 Hydrofluosilicic Acid 40 $ No Bid ea. $
4 Ferric Chloride 180,000 $ No Bid lb. $
5 Polymer 9,500 $ No Bid lb. $
6 WSU 350 Phosphate 10,500 $ 3.37 lb. $ 35,385.00

1 Liquid Chlorine - 150 lbs. 70 $ No Bid ea. $
2 Liquid Chlorine - 1 Ton 8 $ No Bid ea. $
3 Hydrofluosilicic Acid 40 $ No Bid ea. $
4 Ferric Chloride 180,000 $ 0.300 lb. $ 54,000.00
5 Polymer 9,500 $ No Bid lb. $
6 WSU 350 Phosphate 10,500 $ No Bid lb. $

1 Liquid Chlorine - 150 lbs. 70 $ 179.00 ea. $ 12,530.00
2 Liquid Chlorine - 1 Ton 8 $ 2,189.00 ea. $ 17,512.00
3 Hydrofluosilicic Acid 40 $ 319.00 ea. $ 12,760.00
4 Ferric Chloride 180,000 $ No Bid lb. $
5 Polymer 9,500 $ No Bid lb. $
6 WSU 350 Phosphate 10,500 $ No Bid lb. $

Item ESTIMATED QUANTITY

CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION

PUBLIC WORKS DOCUMENT NO. PW-24-03
FY 24-25 CHEMICALS

BID OPENING: Tuesday February 6th, 2024    11:00 AM

Shannon Chemical Corporation
P.O. box 376
Malvern, PA 19355

lbs.

150 lbs.
1 Tons
Drums
lbs.
lbs.

lbs.
lbs.

150 lbs.

SNF Polydyne
1 Chemical Plant Road
P.O. Box 279
Riceboro, GA 31323

lbs.

150 lbs.
1 Tons
Drums

UNIT PRICE TOTAL

Brenntag Mid-South Inc.
4616 South Enterprise Dr.
Bartonville, Illinois 61607

lbs.

Water Solutions Unlimited
8824 Union Mills Drive
Camby, Indiana 46113

lbs.

lbs.
lbs.

150 lbs.
1 Tons
Drums
lbs.
lbs.

150 lbs.
1 Tons
Drums

Kemira Water Solutions
4321 West 6th Street
Lawrence, Kansas 66049 lbs.

Alexander Chemical Corp.
315 Fifth Street
Peru, Illinois 61354

lbs.
lbs.
lbs.

lbs.
lbs.

150 lbs.
1 Tons
Drums

150 lbs.
1 Tons
Drums

Hawkins Inc.
1149 Enterprise Dr.
Havana, IL 62644

1 Tons
Drums
lbs.
lbs.
lbs.



 
 
 
 

 

COMPANY ESTIMATED QUANTITY

Midwest Salt LLC.
1300 West Washington Street
West Chicago, Illinois 63147

1,250 Tons $ 126.00 $ 157,500.00

CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION

PUBLIC WORKS DOCUMENT NO. PW-24-04
FY 24-25 SOFTENER SALT

BID OPENING: Tuesday February 6th, 2024     11:00 AM

TOTALUNIT PRICE

COMPANY
TREE REMOVAL 
PRICE PER TREE

D.B.H

6" - 18" $ $300.00
19" - 30" $ $600.00
31" - 42" $ $825.00
43" and Up $ $1,525.00

UNIT PRICE STUMP REMOVAL Alternate Bid
Price Per Hour

TREE TRIMMING
Price Per Hour

$ 3.00 Per Inch $ 240.00 $ 160.00
Durdel  & Sons 
Tree Service

CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION

PUBLIC WORKS DOCUMENT NO. PW-24-05
FY 24-25 TREE MAINTENANCE

BID OPENING: Tuesday February 6th, 2024     11:00 AM



 
 
 
 

COMPANY

Quantity 
Delivered 
Flat Work
Per Sq. Ft.

< 200 $ 12.00 $ 48,000.00

≥ 200 $ 12.00 $ 48,000.00

Quantity 
Delivered 
Curb Work

Per LF
< 20 $ 100.00 $ 50,000.00

≥ 20 $ 100.00 $ 50,000.00

COMPANY

Quantity 
Delivered 
Flat Work
Per Sq. Ft.

< 200 $ 12.00 $ 48,000.00

≥ 200 $ 12.00 $ 48,000.00

Quantity 
Delivered 
Curb Work

Per LF
< 20 $ 84.00 $ 42,000.00

≥ 20 $ 84.00 $ 42,000.00

C & G Concrete
1906 Meadows Ave
East Peoria, Illinois 61611

CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION

PUBLIC WORKS DOCUMENT NO. PW-24-06
FY 24-25 CONCRETE ASSISTANCE

BID OPENING: Tuesday February 6th, 2024     11:00 AM

Additional 
Thickness 

Charge      
per CY

Removal 
Trucking   

per SQ FT

Unit Price
Flat Work
Per Sq. Ft.

Estimated 
Quantity

Sq. Ft.
Extended 

Total
4,000 SF

4,000 SF

Extended 
Total

Estimated 
Quantity

LF

Unit Price
Curb Work

Per LF
500 LF

500 LF

3.00/sq.ft

$

Lonewolf Concrete Inc.
1406 Timberline Rd.
Goodfield, Illinois 61742

Estimated 
Quantity

LF

4,000 SF

4,000 SF

Removal 
Trucking   

per SQ FT

500 LF

Estimated 
Quantity

Sq. Ft.

$ 140.00 $ 2.00/sq.ft

$ 4.00/sq.ft
500 LF

Unit Price
Curb Work

Per LF
Extended 

Total

150.00 $ 5.00/sq.ft

$ $150.00

$196,000.00

Unit Price
Flat Work
Per Sq. Ft.

Extended 
Total

Additional 
Thickness 

Charge      
per CY

$180,000.00



 

Company
Information

Map ID Location
 

Quantity Service
 

Application 
May $ 500.00

September $ 500.00

Optional 3rd $ 500.00

May $ 450.00

September $ 450.00

Optional 3rd $ 450.00

May $ 1,975.00

September $ 1,975.00

Optional 3rd $ 1,975.00

May $ 140.00

September $ 140.00

May $ 285.00

September $ 285.00

Optional 3rd $ 285.00

June $ 3,400.00

September $ 3,400.00

Optional 3rd $ 3,400.00

June $ 1,600.00

Optional 2nd $ 1,600.00
City Streets Full Road Width Per Mile Vegetation Control Optional $ 175.00

GND Festival 1800 Washington Rd Lot 3 Acres Vegetation Control Optional $ 345.00
Total $ 15,100.00

Total w/ Optionals $ 23,655.00

City Trails City Recreational Trails 2.5 Miles Vegetation Control

CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION

PUBLIC WORKS DOCUMENT NO. PW-24-07
FY 24-25 WEED SPRAYING

BID OPENING: Tuesday February 6th, 2024     11:00 AM

     Golf Green
Quote

 BR 24 Medians Medians along BR 24  2.5 Acres Vegetation Control

City Streets 3-5 feet of R.O.W & Curb & 
Gutter Both Sides 88 Miles Vegetation Control

Glendale Cemetery Glendale Cemetery 28 Acres Broadleaf Weed Control

City Square City Square and ROW 1 Acre Broadleaf Weed Control

Police Department
Street Department 115 West Jefferson St 2.5 Acres Broadleaf Weed Control

Fire Department 200 North Wilmor Rd 2.0 Acres Broadleaf Weed Control



 

COMPANY
Quantity 

Delivered
0 to 300 LF $ 87.00 $ 59.00 $ 66.00 $ 70.00 $ 82.00 $ 94.00

300 to 1,000 LF $ 65.00 $ 46.00 $ 52.00 $ 58.00 $ 68.00 $ 80.00
Over 1,000 LF $ 43.00 $ 32.00 $ 37.00 $ 40.00 $ 51.00 $ 64.00

End Seals $ 155.00 $ 190.00 $ 210.00 $ 230.00 $ 255.00 $ 295.00
Per Service 
Reconnect

$ 120.00 $ 120.00 $ 120.00 $ 120.00 $ 140.00 $ 160.00

Quantity 
Delivered
0 to 300 LF $ 114.00 $ 144.00 $ $ $ $

300 to 1,000 LF $ 96.00 $ 130.00 $ $ $ $
Over 1,000 LF $ 78.00 $ 104.00 $ Call For Quote

End Seals $ 415.00 $ 445.00 $ $ $ $
Per Service 
Reconnect

$ 160.00 $ 160.00 $ $ $ $

CITY OF WASHINGTON
BID TABULATION

PUBLIC WORKS DOCUMENT NO. PW-24-08
FY 24-25 CIPP LINING

BID OPENING: Tuesday February 6th, 2024     11:00 AM

12 Inch 15 Inch 18 Inch

Hoerr Construction
1415 Copuntry Rd 200 North
Goodfield, Illinois 61742 21 Inch 24 Inch 27 Inch 32 Inch 36 Inch 42 Inch

6 Inch 8 Inch 10 Inch


